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osseous abnormalities of the ankle, including
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process. We report three patients with
osteochondral fractures of the lateral talar
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injury. An anterior approach with intraoperative
radiographic imaging enabled evaluation and
appropriate fixation of the fracture and good
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world's largest real estate agencies is now calling
on the provincial government to step in and
declare an affordable housing emergency in

Winnipeg to protect residents from skyrocketing
rental costs. The Royal LePage said it's studying

the issue and is calling on the province to consider
raising the age of affordability regulations from 20
to 30 years, which could bring more senior citizens

into the
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automation systems have seen great advances in
the last few decades. Many manufacturing, testing
and service industries have adopted automation.
For example, drug discovery, clinical testing, bio-

informatics, healthcare systems, and
manufacturing processes have all benefited from
automation. Oftentimes, the information obtained

from these types of systems can be used to
identify trends in the activities that are performed

or that produce, or are associated with the
production of, a product. This information may be
used to adjust and tune the automation system,
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and/or process associated with the production,
and thereby improve the production or quality of
the product. Conventional monitoring systems,

however, are not capable of collecting and
analyzing massive amounts of data in a timely

manner in order to adjust and tune the automation
system or process. In order to overcome these

shortcomings, conventional monitoring systems
have recently began to use multi-threading

techniques in an attempt to increase the
processing power. While these techniques may

increase the processing power of the monitoring
system, they can lead to inefficiencies, duplicative

processes, and other problems. Further,
conventional monitoring systems are generally

resource constrained in that conventional
monitoring systems are often limited by the

amount of available memory, power, and
processing power of the monitoring system. The

limited processing power
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